
CAROL GLASSMAN, P.C.
4845 PEARL E. CIRCLE, SUITE 101

BOULDER, CO 80301
(303) 442-1403

ALYSON BELL JUNE 13, 2025
ALYSONVARVELBELL@GMAIL.COM CLIENT CODE:  1411.01

MATTER:  DISSOLUTION

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

EMP DESCRIPTION HOURS

May 27, 2025

CEG Review Post Trial Financial Hardship Motion; Review historical pleadings and 0.75  
orders

CEG Review court orders and next draft of pleadings; Instructions to paralegal 0.50  

CEG Review new pleadings; Revise Trial Management Certificate; Start direct testimony; 2.00  
Meeting

May 28, 2025

CEG Hearing preparation 4.50  

May 29, 2025

CEG Review Trial Management Certificate and exhibits filed by Charles; Organize same; 1.50  
Email to Charles regarding missing documents

CEG Revise exhibit 0.30  

CEG Telephone conference with Freedberg 0.35  

May 30, 2025

CEG Read email from Charles; Email to Alyson; Read court order regarding limited 0.60  
filings; Email to Alyson

CEG Review exhibits for objections; Send Charles exhibits 1.25  

CEG Revise testimony 0.60  
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EMP DESCRIPTION HOURS

May 31, 2025

CEG Read email from Alyson; Read Charles' email; Email to Alyson 0.50  

June 1, 2025

CEG Hearing preparation 1.00  

June 2, 2025

CEG Continued preparation for hearing 0.70  

June 3, 2025

ML Format J. Freedberg Subpoena to Attend Motion to Modify Maintenance hearing; 0.25  
Forward for electronic signature; Receive and save in client file.

MAL Administrative assistant - Type objections to Petitioner’s exhibits per CEG 0.25  
notes

ML Upload Alyson’s modification hearing exhibits in the Court file 0.50  

MAL Administrative assistant - Continue typing testimony with CEG 1.50  

ML Mark additional exhibit for hearing; Upload to Court file; Add to Exhibit List 0.20  

CEG Review objections; Revise Trial Management Certificate 0.75  

CEG Review next draft of Objections to exhibits; Instructions to paralegal 0.30  

CEG Review Alyson's testimony; Hearing preparation 2.75  

CEG Revisions to Objections to Exhibits 1.50  

June 4, 2025

ML Update client pleadings file with recently filed pleadings. 0.25  

ML E-file Objections with CCEF. 0.15  

CEG Read numerous pleadings and emails regarding exhibits 1.00  

CEG Pleading preparation regarding exhibit objections; Meeting with Alyson; Review all 4.00  
documents for filing

CEG Prepare Objections to Supplemental Exhibits 2.00  
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June 5, 2025

ML Index recent Court filings by Petitioner in client file; Forward to client; Print 0.75  
trial notebook labels; Update client pleadings index with recently filed trial
pleadings

MAL Administrative assistant - Continue typing testimony with CEG 0.75  

CEG Review Charles' pleadings 1.00  

CEG Hearing preparation 1.50  

June 6, 2025

CEG Research Rule 41 Dismissal Motion 0.25  

June 8, 2025

CEG Hearing preparation 4.00  

June 9, 2025

ML Update client pleadings file with recently filed pleadings 0.25  

MAL Administrative assistant - Continue typing testimony questions and closing 2.25  
argument with CEG

ML Extract exhibits received by C. Bell’s exhibit pleadings into C. Bell exhibit 1.00  
file

CEG Hearing preparation 3.00  

CEG Prepare memorandum regarding Rule 41 Motion to Dismiss 0.75  

June 10, 2025

ML Continue extracting exhibits from Charles’ Trial Management Certificate exhibit 1.50  
list; Extract exhibits from Charles’ three supplemental exhibit lists, organize in
client file; Continue supplementing CEG’s Charles’ Exhibit List to include all
exhibits filed by C. Bell

CEG Hearing preparation 5.50  

June 11, 2025

ML Update client pleadings file with recently filed pleadings 0.10  
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CEG Court appearance in Boulder County District Court for hearing 8.00

June 13, 2025

CEG Read Minute Order; Email to Alyson regarding same; Instructions to paralegal 0.40

SUMMARY OF SERVICES

Attorney/Glassman 51.25 hrs @ 400.00 $ 20,500.00
Administrative/LaPlume 4.75 hrs @ 65.00 $ 308.75
Paralegal/LaPlume 4.95 hrs @ 175.00 $ 866.25

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 60.95 HOURS $ 21,675.00
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